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My title is appropriated from Richard Taruskin’s keynote lecture at the 2006 Bartók conference in 
Budapest, substituting Sibelius for Bartók.[1] His title pertains to the astonishing omission of Bartók from 
the recent Cambridge History of Twentieth-Century Music;[2] mine to the equally surprising exclusion of 
Sibelius from Taruskin’s own Oxford History of Western Music.[3] 

‘It is not as though the name Bartók never appears in The Cambridge History of Twentieth Century Music 
(any more than the name Sibelius never appears in The Oxford History of Western Music)’, Taruskin writes 
and notes that there are eighteen index entries for Bartók.[4] One of them, however, refers to a page on 
which Bartók’s name cannot be found (p. 111); and then there is at least one page (p. 73) on which it occurs 
but for which there is no entry. Here, the author Christopher Butler cites (incorrectly) a sentence from Paul 
Griffiths’s Modern Music without noticing that the sentence he cites is itself a quotation from Bartók’s 
autobiography.[5] Worse is that none of the 22 contributors to the volume really covers Bartók’s music in 
the way Arnold Whittall, in his chapter, discusses the music of Strauss and Vaughan Williams, Poulenc, 
Hindemith and Prokofiev or Britten and Shostakovich. Of Bartók’s works (except for the string quartets, 
referred to as a group) only the Miraculous Mandarin and the Cantata profana are mentioned by name, the 
former for its ‘urban savagery’ and the latter as an example of ‘Weltanschauungsmusik’. 

One gets the feeling that historians have completely lost touch with reality. Such treatment does not do 
justice to the prominence of Bartók’s music in the repertory, neither at present nor at the time these texts 
were written; nor does it relate to the way Bartók and his music are evaluated in other literature on 
twentieth-century music, old or new. In the introduction to the volume, the editor, Nicholas Cooke, makes a 
sort of lame excuse that isn’t one: ‘It is hard to know whether this is to be seen as an accidental 
shortcoming that the editors should have remedied, or as symptomatic of a revaluation of twentieth-century 
classicism that makes Bartók’s particular synthesis appear less important than it once did. Time will tell; 
pending that our authors’ priorities stand.’[6] ‘What nonsense,’ Taruskin replies. ‘Cooke was being silly as 
well as disingenuous’, and failed ‘to do his job properly.’[7] 

Bartók’s coverage (or the lack of it) in the Cambridge History can only be seen in correct proportion when 
compared to that of his contemporaries. In their introduction, the editors unsurprisingly find the music of 
the century split in two. There is ‘a progressive, modernist mainstream’, ‘consolidated and focused through 
Schoenberg’s development of the serial technique, leading after the hiatus of the Second World War to the 
increasingly systematic approaches associated with the “Darmstadt” composers’ on the one hand; and then 
a ‘more dispersed Northern European mainstream’ that ‘might be imagined round – say – Ravel and 
Milhaud in France, Elgar and Holst in Britain, Nielsen and Sibelius in Scandinavia, Rachmaninov and 
Stravinsky in and out of Russia’ on the other. The random pairing of composers in this latter ‘mainstream’ 
– where are Bartók and Janáček?—makes the whole notion suspect. If a mainstream is ‘dispersed’, is it still 
a mainstream at all? It would certainly take some courage to abandon this petrified dialectical model of two 
opposite mainstreams. But to find another kind of approach, richer in nuances, would doubtlessly be 
rewarding and more appropriate at this time when the aesthetics of the ‘progressive, modernist mainstream’ 
and its post-war Darmstadtian lower course have lost much of its authority.[8] 

Compared to Bartók, Sibelius is slightly better off in the Cambridge History, not with regard to the number 
of index entries, but to the substance of the references. The seven symphonies are mentioned as a group (as 
are Bartók’s string quartets) but, in addition, Nos. 1, 4 and 7 are given some individual attention, as well as 
The Oceanides, The Bard, Tapiola and Finlandia. There are also attempts to find a place for Sibelius in 
history. Leon Botstein identifies him (among others) in a sequence of events that took place after the 
Second World War. First, ‘in the final decades of the century a group of composers’, such as Henze and 
Penderecki, ‘abandoned modernism’ and ‘returned to an older palette of musical expression, one that 
circumvented the radical innovations that appeared between 1920 and 1950.’ Then, as a consequence, ‘the 
place in history and the repertory of the vital but once-disparaged twentieth-century conservative and 



neoclassical tradition, including Strauss, Britten, Sibelius, Shostakovich and a host of more minor figures, 
has experienced a striking reassessment as central and not marginal to the twentieth century.’[9] 

In this figure of thought, the observations may be correct, but the cause-effect relation between them seems 
unlikely; and, while the repertory referred to as ‘conservative and neoclassical’ has experienced some 
fluctuation over the decades, it has always been there. But of a reassessment of its place in history, if 
‘history’ means ‘written history’, there are very few signs, yet. It is as if those who write history live in a 
completely different world than performers and audiences. 

Peter Franklin, as a matter of fact, seems to think that way. He writes: ‘That the Sibelius symphonies were 
written off by Adorno and other high modernists as “nationalist”, essentially popular and therefore lacking 
in genuine contemporary relevance, contrarily stresses their relevance, along with such other symphonies as 
Shostakovich’s Fourth, Fifth, and Seventh: they became sites of musical expression and experience in 
which power and nostalgia, “heroic” engagement, escape, lamentation, or euphoric communal celebration 
could be figured in ways that were immediately decipherable in the concert hall or the newly available 
privacy of “home listening”, but endlessly retractable, negotiable, or even deniable in verbal commentaries 
and critical discourse.’[10] 

Pointing in the same direction is Christopher Butler’s remark that artistic innovation and renewal ‘needn’t 
come from an avant-garde, which usually groups together artists who are just a bit more self-conscious 
about “progress”, and more theoretically aware of the nature of art (or at least of that which they don’t 
like)’ and that you ‘can also make progress in a less ludicrously self-conscious manner, even if your 
attachment to consensus practices may seem to be a “conservative” feature.’[11] 

Nevertheless, there is no comprehensive coverage of Sibelius’s music in the Cambridge History, as there is 
no comprehensive coverage of Bartók’s, nothing that could be compared to, say, Arnold Whittall’s essay in 
Musical Composition in the Twentieth Century or Alex Ross’s chapter in The Rest is Noise.[12] 

If one does not accept Nicolas Cooke’s explanation that the omission of Bartók can be seen ‘as 
symptomatic of a revaluation of twentieth-century classicism’, and if one thinks that Sibelius has not been 
given the weight he deserves, one must ask for an explanation. When it comes to Bartók, Taruskin 
identifies two main reasons for his neglect in the Cambridge History: the first is what he calls the ‘poietic 
fallacy’, and the second is Germanocentrism. It seems to me that the same two apply to Sibelius as well. 

The poietic fallacy, as Taruskin defines it in his review article of Allen Shawn’s book Arnold Schoenberg’s 
Journey, is ‘the conviction that what matters most (or more strongly yet, that all that matters) in a work of 
art is the making of it, the maker’s input’; or that structure and coherence, in which the significance of 
music inheres, ‘are the fruits of the composer’s imagination, affording those moments of profound and 
intense beauty that the listener will discover “if he is fortunate”.’ It further means that the ‘composer’s task, 
and the value of the composer’s product, are again unrelated, except fortuitously, to the listener’s 
pleasure.’[13] This line of thought bears traces of German idealism. Eduard Hanslick speaks of imagination 
as ‘the organ from and for which all artistic beauty comes in the first place’,[14] and remarks that the 
beautiful is beautiful ‘only for the pleasure of an observer, but not because of it’,[15] which means that it is 
objective and independent of anybody’s liking or disliking and in this sense almost like a truth that is 
independent of anybody’s opinion. 

Part of the ‘poietic fallacy’, or a consequence of it, Taruskin remarks, is ‘the measurement of an artist’s 
value in terms of influence on other artists, the concomitant overrating of technical innovation, the 
delimitation of the purview of criticism to matters of structure and craft, and the derogation of other critical 
approaches as vulgarian.’[16] 

This is how Bartók is viewed in the Cambridge History, ‘entirely alone, sitting within the four walls of his 
workshop, producing scores.’ No hint of him as a performer, teacher, scholar, emigrant or a controversial 
figure whose ‘music was the site of one of the great cruxes, indeed one of the great pitched battles, in the 



reception history of twentieth-century music.’[17] Much more important than the sheer making of artefacts, 
Taruskin asserts, is ‘the social mediation and reception of music, and the buffeting the arts and their 
practitioners have suffered in the turbulent political environment of the twentieth century.’ These are the 
things, Taruskin concludes, ‘that make Bartók indispensable to the historiography of twentieth-century 
music.’[18] 

Especially important for Taruskin is Bartók’s response to the Nazi Entartete Musik exhibition in 1938. 
‘Stravinsky protested that he had been included, Bartók protested that he had been excluded’, Taruskin 
writes, referring to Stravinsky’s letter to Willi Strecker of B. Schott’s Söhne from 27th May 1938, on the 
one hand, and Bartók’s letter to Hans Priegnitz from 12th January 1939, on the other.[19] But Bartók’s 
letter to Hans Priegnitz doesn’t support this claim. He only answers a request to perform his First Piano 
Concerto on German radio by saying that ‘I am, by the way, astonished that such “degenerate” music 
should be selected for – of all things – a radio broadcast.’[20] Apparently there had been a rumour, though, 
about some kind of a protest earlier, since, in a letter to the editor of the Budapest newspaper Az Est, Bartók 
denies having ‘made, or sent, any statement to German authorities’ up to the date of the letter, 27th March 
1938,[21] i.e. two months before the opening of the exhibition in Düsseldorf. 

This alleged protest to German authorities, of which I have been unable to find any document in the 
literature,[22] Taruskin sees as ‘Bartók’s finest hour’. His emigration to America, Taruskin further remarks, 
‘was not undertaken (as Stravinsky’s was) for the sake of convenience’, but ‘out of idealistic principle’, and 
therefore, Bartók is the one who most awe-inspiringly exemplifies ‘uncompromising devotion to an 
exacting humanitarian code’.[23] 

This argument is part of Taruskin’s campaign against the ‘poietic fallacy’, against the conviction that all 
that matters in a work of art is what it is in itself. He wants the ‘whole story’, not just the music.[24] This 
seems justifiable to some extent. It is perfectly clear, to quote a formulation by Lydia Goehr,[25] that 
musical works ‘are tainted, influenced, shaped, and conditioned by their contexts – historical, cultural, 
social, political, economic, religious, and psychological’. One such work in Bartók’s output is the Sixth 
Quartet, the understanding of which remains incomplete without knowledge of its historical context 
(similar examples can be found in Sibelius’s music around 1900).[26] If the ‘whole story’ means a well-
balanced taking into account of the intrinsic quality of the music, its significance and its relevance for the 
time and the society in which it was conceived, then there can be no objection to it. But if it means 
scrutinizing the life of a composer as a private person, then it is utterly inappropriate. What a composer is 
as a private person, what his or her race, nationality and mother tongue, social background and colour of 
skin, sexual orientation and political opinions may be: all this is irrelevant. Bartók’s ‘uncompromising 
devotion to an exacting humanitarian code’ certainly belongs to history, but not to the history of music. 

The use and misuse of an artist and his art for extra-musical purposes, political, commercial or whatever, 
again are pertinent to the history of music. In many cases such things affect the position of the music in the 
repertory and in people’s minds, often for a long time, as if music somehow had an ideological content 
attached to it afterwards and from outside. Such is the case of, say, Sibelius’s Second Symphony that 
continues to carry the nationalist label Kajanus once assigned to it.[27] 

Bartók’s marginalization is not a singular phenomenon, it is – and this is Taruskin’s second point – ‘a 
symptom of a greater misinterpretation and a traditional one, which goes by the name of 
Germanocentrism.’ This claim might seem surprising if one thinks that such a phenomenon can be met only 
in German musical historiography, where it goes back to Johann Nicolaus Forkel and Franz Brendel, lives 
on in the authorship of Adorno, and shows no signs of weakening in the writings of the late twentieth-
century historians Hans Heinrich Eggebrecht and Hermann Danuser.[28] But, according to Taruskin, it is 
not a German phenomenon only, it is, in fact, ‘so thoroughly ingrained in Anglophone musicology that is 
has become transparent.’[29] 

Taruskin calls it a ‘disease’, the main symptom of which is ‘to confuse the particular with the 
universal.’[30] This opinion is today supported by some German musicologists as well, such as Bernd 



Sponheuer, who discerns two ideal types of the ‘German in music’, one ‘exclusivist’ and the other 
‘universalist’. On the one hand German music is based on ‘depth, hard work, and thoroughness’ (Tiefsinn, 
Arbeit, Gründlichkeit) in contradistinction to the sensuality (Sinnlichkeit) of non-German music; on the 
other it has a ‘universal’ and ‘synthetic’ quality as opposed to the national character of the music of other 
nations. Therefore it ‘brings the “purely human” to its fullest expression’.[31] 

From the point of view of this concept of the German in music, Bartók and Sibelius are equally 
unacceptable. Both come ‘from the periphery’,[32] from countries that have no classical tradition in music, 
let alone a cultural identity. Schoenberg put it as follows in 1947: ‘Peace after the First World War granted 
political independence to nations which culturally were far from ready for it. Nevertheless even small 
nations of six to ten million people expected to be regarded as cultural units, nations whose national 
characteristics expressed themselves in many ways: in their applied arts, weaving, ceramics, painting, 
singing and playing and, finally, even composing music.’[33] 

Bartók’s guilt lies in his rejection of atonality, his refusing to reconcile himself to the demands of the 
‘tendency of the material’ on the one hand, and his use of folk music on the other. In Adorno’s ears, his late 
music had a backward effect that made even many of his most radical works, such as the First Violin 
Sonata, appear harmless. ‘What once seemed a prairie fire’, Adorno wrote in 1954, ‘reveals itself as 
Csárdás, and even the exposed piano pieces in “Out of Doors” sound today like a dried up Debussy, a kind 
of softened art of the sentiment.’[34] René Leibowitz accused Bartók of a ‘spirit of compromise’ because 
of his rejection of twelve-note composition, the sole method that, according to him, allows a mastery of all 
the possibilities of chromatic polyphony.[35] 

Sibelius made the same mistakes. He composed tonally in the era of atonal music that Schoenberg initiated 
in 1907–09. ‘Not only are these sounds obsolete and unfashionable. They are false. They no longer fulfil 
their function… When a contemporary composer, such as Jean Sibelius, makes do entirely with tonal 
resources, they sound just as false as do the tonal enclaves in atonal music.’[36] And if Sibelius did not 
make use of folk music, he certainly worshipped nature as a source of beauty, strength and inspiration. The 
sound of nature that many an urban intellectual in Central Europe hears in his music prevents it from rising 
to universality.[37] Nature was seen as the opposite of culture. 

Adorno’s and Leibowitz’s criticism of Bartók and Sibelius is camouflaged as criticism of the material and 
structure of their music, but is fundamentally ideological, and part of the ‘purification’ of cultural life that 
took place both in Germany and in France after the war.[38] In Adorno’s thinking, musical taste and 
political orientation correlated in such a way that tonality and folk music were associated with Nazi 
populism and ‘degenerated’ New Music with anti-Nazism. Leibowitz saw it the same way. He was 
influenced by Sartre’s ideas and French purification trials against the collaborators. In his view, Bartók 
showed moral weakness and disquieting lack of purity when, after the Fourth Quartet (1928), he abandoned 
modernism.[39] 

In ‘Music of the Early Twentieth Century’, the fourth volume of his Oxford History of Western Music, 
Richard Taruskin dedicates 56 pages (out of around 800) to Bartók and shows that there is no reason, even 
in poietic terms, to disregard his music, rich in technical invention and solid in craft as it is.[40] The more 
surpsing it is to find Sibelius mentioned on three pages only, and not even for the sake of his own music, 
but as ‘the most tangible model’ for the American composer Roy Harris. In this context Taruskin describes 
Sibelius as follows: ‘Sibelius, while acknowledged (especially by American critics) as legitimate heir to the 
romantic symphonic tradition, was widely regarded as the last of a dying breed; by many Europeans, 
indeed, he was already thought of as a sort of dinosaur. He had not produced a new symphony in fifteen 
years; although he lived to the age of ninety-one, he would never do so. His unironized rhetorical eloquence 
suffered in the general postwar atmosphere of disillusion. Although his later symphonies were decidedly 
restrained compared with his prewar output, they bore a suspicious taint of bombast.’[41] To support his 
opinion, he then quotes Virgil Thomson’s well-known sentence that Sibelius is ‘vulgar, self-indulgent and 
provincial beyond all description.’[42] Regrettably, the quotation is not accurate: Thomson did not say that 
of Sibelius but of his Second Symphony.[43] 



Essentially, Taruskin’s assessment is perfectly in line with the way Sibelius is handled in Hermann 
Danuser’s Die Musik des 20. Jahrhunderts, published two decades earlier. ‘While, for example, the English 
symphonic music of Edward Elgar and Ralph Vaughan Williams or the Finnish of Jean Sibelius, which – 
composed far from the centres where the conversions of the tradition were taking place around 1910 – were 
still building upon the carrying capacity of the great tonal forms and were therefore – despite their partly 
national, partly international popularity – doomed to epigonism, Mahler’s late music brought not only the 
fin de siècle but a great epoch, the musical nineteenth century, to a conclusion.’[44] These lines are worthy 
of quoting not only as a touching example of unanimousness between two historians of totally different 
breeds, but also as illustrative of German exclusivism when it comes to symphonic music around 1900. 

In ‘Music in the Late Twentieth Century’, the fifth volume of his history, Taruskin mentions Sibelius once, 
wondering how Peter Maxwell Davies, of all people, came to ‘write six proper symphonies cast 
deliberately in a line with those of Sibelius, long a favourite with British audiences.’[45] This is all 
Taruskin’s readers will find on Sibelius in two large volumes covering twentieth-century music, which 
indicates that, in Taruskin’s world, Sibelius doesn’t belong to the twentieth century. 

The curious reader then turns to the nineteenth century to see if he can find him there; and there he is, on 
the last couple of pages of ‘Music in the Nineteenth Century’ in the company of Grieg, Sæverud, Nielsen, 
Pettersson, Vagn Holmboe and Copland, a strange collection of some Scandinavians and an American 
‘nationalist’ – strange because all of them (except Grieg) are twentieth-century composers.[46] 

Taruskin’s decision to push Sibelius back to the nineteenth century was possibly encouraged by Carl 
Dahlhaus’s discussion of Sibelius in Nineteenth-Century Music. There is one difference, though. For 
Dahlhaus, the nineteenth century in music is the period between 1814 and 1914, politically between the 
Congress of Vienna and the outburst of the First World War.[47] When he writes that ‘it would be wrong to 
call a work like his Fourth Symphony a late-romantic relic in need of special geographical pleading to 
justify it aesthetically in the midst of musical modernism’[48] but neglects to comment on the later 
symphonies, this does not mean, as James Hepokoski supposes, that in Dahlhaus’s view, ‘after the Fourth 
Symphony Sibelius’s music no longer belongs to “history”.’[49] The later symphonies are simply outside 
the range of his book. 

Now one becomes curious about what Taruskin has to say about Sibelius as a nineteenth-century composer. 
First, he describes the reception of Sibelius’s music in various countries, naming friends and enemies. ‘His 
ten symphonic poems, composed between 1892 (En Saga) and 1926 (Tapiola), and, even more decisively, 
his seven symphonies, composed between 1899 and 1924, gained him widespread recognition at home, in 
the rest of Scandinavia, and in the English speaking countries (though significantly less so in Germany and 
hardly at all in the Romance-speaking world) as the greatest symphonist after Brahms. His reputation has 
endured vicissitudes and challenges (especially since the 1960s, when Gustav Mahler began to emerge as a 
repertory composer), and Sibelius has never been without detractors, but the long controversy is in itself 
testimony to Sibelius’s potency.’ 

Second, he writes of Sibelius as a nationalist, describing Finlandia as a ‘noisy festivity culminating in a 
cantabile hymn that… could be variously read as celebratory or seditious.’ Third, he makes comments on 
some works, mentions Sibelius’s conversation with Mahler, shows some themes from the ‘cryptic’ Fourth 
and, exactly like Dahlhaus, cites Sibelius’s spring-water metaphor of the Sixth and notes that the form of 
the Seventh ‘has been for generations of analysts and commentators an enduring riddle’. Finally, he turns to 
Sibelius’s position as a national monument, to his enormous authority in the 1920s and 1930s and to his 
posthumous reputation, writing that having ‘been touted by the Nazis during World War II as a result of his 
country’s alliance with Germany (motivated by a well-grounded fear of Soviet Russia…), Sibelius fell into 
a trough of disdain for a couple of decades, written off as a reactionary during a time of avant-garde 
ascendency, and only regained full respectability in the 1970s.’ [50] 

What Taruskin omits, is that Sibelius’s music has become increasingly influential on contemporary music, 
especially in the 1980s and 1990s.[51] This is one reason why you cannot leave Sibelius out. When writing 



on Bartók in chapter 7 of 'Music in the Early Twentieth-Century' Taruskin uses Bartók’s own writings as a 
source and quotes some theoretical work on his music (by Elliot Antokoletz, George Perle, and Leo 
Treitler) from the 1950s and 1970s. In addition to that, he makes analytical observations of his own on 
some works (such as the Bagatelles op. 6, and Music for Strings, Percussion, and Celesta), which show 
that, while not being a ’card-carrying Batókian’,[52] he is well acquainted with the Hungarian master’s 
music. For some reason, he chooses not to do similar work on Sibelius, although analytical literature and 
other relevant sources on Sibelius’s music were readily available years before the publication of his 
book.[53] This must be seen as a value judgement. Does Virgil Thomson’s invective from 1940 (or 
Adorno’s 'Gloss' from 1938) still obscure clear sight of Sibelius’s music in some Anglophone musicology, 
or is it his alleged Nazi-mindedness? Influence, technical innovation, structure and craft all belong to the 
realm of ‘poietics’. When it comes to ‘the social mediation and reception of music, and the buffeting the 
arts and their practitioners have suffered in the turbulent political environment of the twentieth century’, 
Sibelius is no less interesting a case than Schoenberg and Bartók. Taruskin seems to be aware of this, but 
he chooses not to elaborate on it, either. 

One final point deserves a comment. Taruskin begins his review article of Allen Shawn’s Arnold 
Schoenberg’s Journey by writing that ‘During his lifetime, and even – astonishingly – in the half-century 
since his death, the music of Arnold Schoenberg has been influential and controversial out of all proportion 
to the frequency with which it has ever been performed or otherwise disseminated.’[54] Exactly the 
opposite is true of the music of Sibelius, and this is perhaps the most compelling reason not to leave him 
out. Music history is, after all, not made within the four walls of the composer’s (and the historian’s) 
workshop only, but in the concert hall, where the composer meets the grand jury: the audience. 
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